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Executive Summary 
 
Community consultation on the Proposed Voluntary Planning Agreement for 7-15 Centennial 
Avenue, Lane Cove has been completed and the purpose of this report is to advise of the results of 
the community consultation and recommend that Council enter into a Voluntary Planning 
Agreement with Hyecorp.  
 
Discussion 
 
At the Council Meeting of 21 October 2013, Council resolved to place the proposed Voluntary 
Planning Agreement on public exhibition for 6 weeks in conjunction with the proposed 
Development Application for this site. Council undertook community consultation on the proposed 
Agreement and communicated this to the public by an advertisement in the North Shore Times,  
e-newsletter to over 8,900 subscribers, public exhibitions at Council’s Civic Centre and Libraries 
and providing information on the Agreement on Council’s website. Surveys were also available at 
Council’s Civic Centre and Libraries and an online version was available on Council’s website. The 
Explanatory Note required by legislation to be exhibited in conjunction with the Agreement which 
outlines proposal is shown attached as AT-1. 
 
12 written submissions were received and 36 online surveys were completed. 26 responses were 
in favour of the proposal and 19 against the proposal with 3 submissions not stating whether they 
were for or against the proposal. The submissions received provided comment on the following 
broad issues:- 
 
Financial Compensation  
 
13 submissions stated that the proposed financial compensation to Council is not sufficient. 
Council staff asked Hill PDA , a firm of qualified valuers, land economists and planners who 
provided the original valuation and assessment on the proposal to provide further comment on the 
financial compensation to Council. They indicate:- 
 
“1. Hill PDA’s assessment recognised that the Hector proposal does not result in any additional 
floorspace entitlements (and thereby no additional units over the permitted FSR) across the sites at 
7-15 Centennial Avenue. The development application is therefore entitled to redistribute 
floorspace across the development site provided it is within the development envelop.  
 
2. The proposed development would however require additional building height leading to a 
potential increase in development profit as a result of potentially better views and privacy. Based 
on our market research we quantified this additional value as between $310,000 to $465,000.  
 
3. The benefit of the proposed development to the community, owing to the dedication of land to 
form part of the Batten Reserve and a financial contribution was estimated as $537,000 (between 
$72,000 and $227,000 more than the developer).  
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4. This benefit to the Community continues to be greater than the benefit to the developer even 
after a 75% discount on the developers land value (from their purchase price of $1.45 to $362k on 
account of the development potential of the site being given to the neighbouring site).  
 
5. Our assessment also acknowledged, yet did not quantify that the development proposal would 
result in land being dedicated to the bushland of the Batten Reserve. The value of the bushland to 
the community and local ecology has an intrinsic value that if quantified would add to the benefits 
of the proposal to the Community further outweighing the benefits to the developer.  
 
6. As a final matter, the argument that the transferred units to a higher level would result in a lower 
construction cost (as they are built on existing structure) is mistaken. Rather construction costs per 
square metre increase with building height. Furthermore the basement car parking being restricted 
to a smaller site area (due to the dedication of land) is also likely to result in a higher charge per 
car space if additional levels are required. As a consequence the additional building height is likely 
to result in a greater cost to the developer rather than a cost saving”.  
 
As a result, Hill PDA are of the review that the community would be receiving a greater benefit from 
the proposal than the developer. 
 
Redistribution of Floor Space 
 
8 Submissions raised concern about the proposal to redistribute floor space across the 
development taking into account the transfer of 15 Centennial Avenue to Council. Refer to Point 1 
of Hill PDA’s advice above. 
 
Traffic and Development Issues 
 
13 Submissions raised concern about the traffic associated with the development and other 
development issues. These issues will be considered as part of the assessment of the 
Development Application. The issues would apply equally if 15 Centennial was developed in 
isolation.  
 
Purchase of 15 Centennial Avenue 
 
1 submission proposed that Council purchase the property from Hyecorp and not enter into a 
planning agreement with them. Hyecorp have not offered the site to Council and have declined to 
do so when approached. 
 
Memorial Plaque 
 
1 submission proposed that Council install a memorial plaque at 15 Centennial Avenue, part of this 
submission is shown below:-.  
 
“It would be nice to think that the house where I lived and spent many happy years since 1978 has 
as its memorial a little park with trees and seats that look over the treed green space I enjoyed for 
so many years. It should have a little memorial plaque to the house that once was there and the 
creative environment it provided for some of my inventions that now reside in the Powerhouse 
Museum”. 
 
The site is proposed to be regenerated as bushland. Consideration to the request can be given 
once the regeneration plan is developed.  
 
 
 
 



Ordinary Council Meeting 16 December 2013 
RESULTS OF COMMUNITY CONSULTATION ON THE PROPOSED VOLUNTARY PLANNING 

AGREEMENT FOR 7-15 CENTENNIAL AVENUE LANE COVE 
 
 

Agenda Page 19 

 
 
 
Conclusion 
 
Council received 48 submissions in relation to the proposed Voluntary Planning Agreement with 26 
(more than half) in favour of the proposal. Of those against the proposal many were concerned that 
Council was not receiving sufficient financial consideration from the Developer. Council sought 
further advice from Hill PDA that confirmed that under the current proposal the community would 
be receiving a greater benefit than the Developer. The VPA is therefore supported. 
 
Reco

 
mmendation 

RECOMMENDATION 
 
That Council enter into a Voluntary Planning Agreement for 7-15 Centennial Avenue, Lane Cove, 
as outlined in the explanatory note and authorise the Mayor and General Manager to sign the 
Agreement and affix Council’s seal to any necessary documents. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
Craig Dalli 
Executive Manager - Corporate Services 
Corporate Services Division  
 
 

ATTACHMENTS: 
AT-1 View Explanatory Note - Hyecorp Voluntary Planning 

Agreement 
7 Pages  

  
 

http://ecouncil.lanecove.nsw.gov.au/trim/GenDocLink.asp?RecId=57301/13
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Explanatory Note - Hyecorp Voluntary Planning Agreement 
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